
Affiliated Products

Jackson Line Card
Products & Systems Solutions

Morganizer
100% outside air units - DX split systems and 
packaged RTUs
www.morganizer.com

MTA - USA
Industrial process cooling chillers
www.mta-usa.com

MultiAqua
Air-cooled water chillers, ductless split 
systems for commercial and residential air 
conditioning and heating needs
www.multiaqua.com

Oilon
High temperature and high capacity heat 
recovery/heat pump chillers
www.oilon.com/en-gb

Renew Aire
Fixed-plate energy recovery units
www.renewaire.com

Temspec
Vertical stack fan coils
www.temspec.com

Valent
High-percentage outdoor air packaged 
rooftop ventilation systems
www.valentair.com

Advance Industrial Mechanical
Air source boilers, modular chillers, active 
heat recovery
www.air-eng.com

Canariis
Canariis Corporation UL listed packaged 
systems
www.canariis.com

Carel
Industrial and commercial humidifiers
www.carelusa.com

Evergreen UV
In-duct airstream disinfection systems
www.lumalier.com

Friedrich
VTAC and PTAC units
www.friedrich.com

Genesis Air
Air cleaning system combining technologies 
to control particles, gases and explosion 
proof chillers
www.genesisair.com

KCC Companies
MSP packaged and split heat exchanger 
based dehumidification, curbs and adapters
www.kcccompanies.com

MJC
Custom HVAC units, HVAC coatings, HVAC 
modifications and air turnover
www.mjcinc.com

Your Single Source 
Solutions Provider
Trane Jackson
851 Wilson Drive
Ridgeland, MS 39157
Trane.com/jackson

Contact Us
southeast@trane.com
(601) 718-5750

Office Hours
Monday – Friday
8:00 AM – 5:00 PM

For more information visit  
trane.com/jackson
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